City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: April 29, 2022
Non-Local Local Non-Local Non-Local Local Non-Local

For: Purchase of Off Road Equipment H&E Equipment HoltCat, LTD American Material Associated Supply Texas State Rental Austin Turf & Tractor

Services Handling Company, Inc. dba,
ASCO Equipment
6100015306 LD |5327 Tex-Con Rd 5665 SE Loop 410 3651 Mars Hill Road [2102 E. Slayton Rd. [803 SE Loop 410 809 Steve Hawkins
Pkwy
Item Description QTY |San Antonio, San Antonio, Watkinville, Lubbock, San Antonio, Marble Falls,
TX 78220 TX 78222 GA 30677 TX 79404 TX 78220 TX 78654
210-655-0048 210-213-3143 770-381-8436 806-745-2000 512-557-8454 210-601-1831
1 Operator Propelled Rotary Line Remover: 3

Price Each: $10,208.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Total: $30,624.00
Year, Make & Model Offered: 2022 Smith
Manufacturing LNX8
heavy duty traffic line
eraser|
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered Honda GXV390 13HP|
(Include SAE net HP):
Warranty: 90 Day Warranty|
Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: H&E Equipment
Services
Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 5327 Tex-Con Rd.,
San Antonio, TX
78220
Delivery: 30 Days|
Production Cut-off Date: Nov.30, 2022
Last day order can be placed without Nov.30, 2022
missing cut-off date:
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off No
date:
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: April 29, 2022
Non-Local Local Non-Local Non-Local Local Non-Local
For: Purchase of Off Road Equipment H&E Equipment HoltCat, LTD American Material Associated Supply Texas State Rental Austin Turf & Tractor
Services Handling Company, Inc. dba,
ASCO Equipment
6100015306 LD |[5327 Tex-Con Rd 5665 SE Loop 410 3651 Mars Hill Road |2102 E. Slayton Rd. |803 SE Loop 410 809 Steve Hawkins
Pkwy
Item Description QTY |San Antonio, San Antonio, Watkinville, Lubbock, San Antonio, Marble Falls,
TX 78220 TX 78222 GA 30677 TX 79404 TX 78220 TX 78654
210-655-0048 210-213-3143 770-381-8436 806-745-2000 512-557-8454 210-601-1831
2 Light Duty Vibratory Compactor: 4
Price Each: $7,780.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Total: $31,120.00
Percentage between lowest responsive bid
and local bid:
Price Differential:
Year, Make & Model Offered: 2022 Bomag BW55E
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered Honda GX120 4HP|
(Include SAE net HP):
Warranty: 1 year bumper to|
bumper to bumper, 2
year Honda engine
Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: H&E Equipment
Services
Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 5327 Tex-Con Rd.,
San Antonio, TX
78220
Delivery: 30 Days|
Production Cut-off Date: Nov.30, 2022
Last day order can be placed without Nov.30, 2022
missing cut-off date:
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off No
date:
Prepared by Purchasing 7/20/2022 2 of 26




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: April 29, 2022
Non-Local Local Non-Local Non-Local Local Non-Local
For: Purchase of Off Road Equipment H&E Equipment HoltCat, LTD American Material Associated Supply Texas State Rental Austin Turf & Tractor
Services Handling Company, Inc. dba,
ASCO Equipment
6100015306 LD |5327 Tex-Con Rd 5665 SE Loop 410 3651 Mars Hill Road [2102 E. Slayton Rd. [803 SE Loop 410 809 Steve Hawkins
Pkwy
Item Description QTY |San Antonio, San Antonio, Watkinville, Lubbock, San Antonio, Marble Falls,
TX 78220 TX 78222 GA 30677 TX 79404 TX 78220 TX 78654
210-655-0048 210-213-3143 770-381-8436 806-745-2000 512-557-8454 210-601-1831
3 Trailer Mounted QOil Distributors: 2
Price Each: No Bid $24,308.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Total: $48,616.00
Year, Make & Model Oil Distributor Offered: 2022/23 Weiler TT500
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered Kohler 5.5HP,
(Include SAE net HP):
Make & Model of Trailer Offered: Weiler
Oil Distributor & Trailer Warranty: 12 Months/Unlimited
Hours & Miles|
Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: HoltCat
Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 5665 SE Loop 410,
San Antonio, TX]|
78222
Delivery: 110 Days
Production Cut-off Date: 2022 Ends 9/30/22
Last day order can be placed without Unknown
missing cut-off date:
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off Unknown
date:
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: April 29, 2022
Non-Local Local Non-Local Non-Local Local Non-Local
For: Purchase of Off Road Equipment H&E Equipment HoltCat, LTD American Material Associated Supply Texas State Rental Austin Turf & Tractor
Services Handling Company, Inc. dba,
ASCO Equipment
6100015306 LD |5327 Tex-Con Rd 5665 SE Loop 410 3651 Mars Hill Road [2102 E. Slayton Rd. [803 SE Loop 410 809 Steve Hawkins
Pkwy
Item Description QTY |San Antonio, San Antonio, Watkinville, Lubbock, San Antonio, Marble Falls,
TX 78220 TX 78222 GA 30677 TX 79404 TX 78220 TX 78654
210-655-0048 210-213-3143 770-381-8436 806-745-2000 512-557-8454 210-601-1831
4 6,000 Ib. Pneumatic Tired Forklift LPG: 5
Price Each: No Bid No Bid $30,324.00 $34,409.00 $31,696.95 No Bid
Total: $151,620.00 $172,045.00 $158,484.75
Percentage between lowest responsive bid 4.53%
and local bid:
Price Differential: $6,864.75
Year, Make & Model Offered: 2022-2023 Doosan| 2022 Doosan G30E- 2022 Liugong
G30, 6,000 Ibs Forklift 7LP CLG2030G-3
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered Hyundai, 63 HP|| HMC 2.4L L4KB-C1 Kubota 2.5L
(Include SAE net HP): (65HP) (58.3 Hp)
Warranty: Doosan Assurance -| Doosan Assurance - 3YR/6000 HR
Standard 2 Year / Standard 2 Year /
3,000 Houir, 3,000 Hour,
Powertrain 3 Year / Powertrain 3 Year /
6,000 Hour, Oilf| 6,000 Hour, OCDB 5
Cooled Disc Brakes 5 Years 10,000 Hour
Years 10,000 Hour|
Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: ASCO| ASCO Equipment| Texas State Rentals
Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 1920 S East Loop 1920 SE Loop 410, 803 SE Loop 410,
410, San Antonio, TX|[ San Antonio, Texas San Antonio, TX
78220 78220 78220
Delivery: 400 Days| 180 Days 180 Days
Production Cut-off Date: TBD| 9-30-22 7115122
Last day order can be placed without TBD| 8-31-22 7115122
missing cut-off date:
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off Yes No No
date:
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: April 29, 2022
Non-Local Local Non-Local Non-Local Local Non-Local
For: Purchase of Off Road Equipment H&E Equipment HoltCat, LTD American Material Associated Supply Texas State Rental Austin Turf & Tractor
Services Handling Company, Inc. dba,
ASCO Equipment
6100015306 LD |5327 Tex-Con Rd 5665 SE Loop 410 3651 Mars Hill Road [2102 E. Slayton Rd. [803 SE Loop 410 809 Steve Hawkins
Pkwy
Item Description QTY |San Antonio, San Antonio, Watkinville, Lubbock, San Antonio, Marble Falls,
TX 78220 TX 78222 GA 30677 TX 79404 TX 78220 TX 78654
210-655-0048 210-213-3143 770-381-8436 806-745-2000 512-557-8454 210-601-1831
5 Tracked Skid Loader w/Attachments: 1
Price Each: No Bid $80,099.00 No Bid $68,498.00 No Bid No Bid
Total: $80,099.00 $68,498.00
Percentage between lowest responsive bid 16.94%
and local bid:
Price Differential: $11,601.00
Year, Make & Model Offered: 2023 Caterpillar 2022/23 Case
289 D3 TR310B
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered Cat C3.3B DIT 72.9 FPT F5H FL463
(Include SAE net HP): Net HP A*G001 (74HP)
Warranty: 24 months/2,000 1 year/unlimited hour|
Hours or 2 yr/2,000 hr|
Factory)|
Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: HoltCat ASCO Equipment
Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 5665 SE Loop 410, 1920 SE Loop 410,
San Antonio, TX San Antonio, Texas
78222 78220
Delivery: 200 Days 180 Days|
Production Cut-off Date: Unknown 9-31-22
Last day order can be placed without Unknown 8-31-22
missing cut-off date:
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off Unknown No|
date:
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: April 29, 2022
Non-Local Local Non-Local Non-Local Local Non-Local
For: Purchase of Off Road Equipment H&E Equipment HoltCat, LTD American Material Associated Supply Texas State Rental Austin Turf & Tractor
Services Handling Company, Inc. dba,
ASCO Equipment
6100015306 LD |[5327 Tex-Con Rd 5665 SE Loop 410 3651 Mars Hill Road [2102 E. Slayton Rd. [803 SE Loop 410 809 Steve Hawkins
Pkwy
Item Description QTY |San Antonio, San Antonio, Watkinville, Lubbock, San Antonio, Marble Falls,
TX 78220 TX 78222 GA 30677 TX 79404 TX 78220 TX 78654
210-655-0048 210-213-3143 770-381-8436 806-745-2000 512-557-8454 210-601-1831
6 Wheeled Skid Loader — Open Cab min 60 HP: 1
Price Each: No Bid No Bid No Bid $49,900.00 $48,096.71 No Bid
Total: $49,900.00 $48,096.71
Year, Make & Model Offered: 2022/23 Case 2022 Gehl R165|
SR175B
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered Perkins 404F-E22TA|  Yanmar 4TNV98C-
(Include SAE net HP): (67HP)[| NM52V Stage V (68.3
Hp)
Warranty: 1 year/unlimited hour| 2YR/2000 HR
or 2 yr/2,000 hr
Factory)|
Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: ASCO Equipment|| Texas State Rentals|
Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 1920 SE Loop 410, 803 SE Loop 410,
San Antonio, Texas San Antonio, TX
78220 78220
Delivery: 180 Days| 360 Days
Production Cut-off Date: 9-30-22 7/15/22
Last day order can be placed without 8-31-22 7/15/22
missing cut-off date:
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off No No
date:
Prepared by Purchasing 7/20/2022 6 of 26




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: April 29, 2022
Non-Local Local Non-Local Non-Local Local Non-Local
For: Purchase of Off Road Equipment H&E Equipment HoltCat, LTD American Material Associated Supply Texas State Rental Austin Turf & Tractor
Services Handling Company, Inc. dba,
ASCO Equipment
6100015306 LD |5327 Tex-Con Rd 5665 SE Loop 410 3651 Mars Hill Road [2102 E. Slayton Rd. [803 SE Loop 410 809 Steve Hawkins
Pkwy
Item Description QTY |San Antonio, San Antonio, Watkinville, Lubbock, San Antonio, Marble Falls,
TX 78220 TX 78222 GA 30677 TX 79404 TX 78220 TX 78654
210-655-0048 210-213-3143 770-381-8436 806-745-2000 512-557-8454 210-601-1831
7 Wheeled Skid Loader — Enclosed, min 69 1
HP:
Price Each: No Bid $56,775.00 No Bid $55,739.00 No Bid No Bid
Total: $56,775.00 $55,739.00
Percentage between lowest responsive bid 1.86%
and local bid:
Price Differential: $1,036.00
Year, Make & Model Offered: 2023 Caterpillar] 2022/23 CASE
236D3 SR210B
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered Cat C3.3B DIT 73.2 FPT F5H FL463
(Include SAE net HP): Net HP A*GO001 (74HP
Warranty: 24 months/2000 1 year/unlimited hour
Hours| or 2 yr/2,000 hr
Factory
Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: HoltCat ASCO Equipment
Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 5665 S. E. Loop 410, 1920 SE Loop 410,
San Antonio, TX]| San Antonio, Texas
78222 78220
Delivery: 210 Days| 180 Days
Production Cut-off Date: Unknown 9-30-22
Last day order can be placed without Unknown 8-31-22
missing cut-off date:
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off Unknown No
date:
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: April 29, 2022
Non-Local Local Non-Local Non-Local Local Non-Local
For: Purchase of Off Road Equipment H&E Equipment HoltCat, LTD American Material Associated Supply Texas State Rental Austin Turf & Tractor
Services Handling Company, Inc. dba,
ASCO Equipment
6100015306 LD |[5327 Tex-Con Rd 5665 SE Loop 410 3651 Mars Hill Road |2102 E. Slayton Rd. |803 SE Loop 410 809 Steve Hawkins
Pkwy
Item Description QTY |San Antonio, San Antonio, Watkinville, Lubbock, San Antonio, Marble Falls,
TX 78220 TX 78222 GA 30677 TX 79404 TX 78220 TX 78654
210-655-0048 210-213-3143 770-381-8436 806-745-2000 512-557-8454 210-601-1831
8 DELETED:
9 Tired Pneumatic Roller: 1
Price Each: No Bid $125,375.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Total: $125,375.00
Year, Make & Model Offered: 2022/23 Caterpillar]
CW16
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered Cat C3.4B 100.5 HP
(Include SAE net HP):
Warranty: 24 Months/Unlimited
Hours
Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: HoltCat
Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 5665 S. E. Loop 410,
San Antonio, TX|
78222
Delivery: 185 Days|
Production Cut-off Date: Unknown
Last day order can be placed without Unknown
missing cut-off date:
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off Unknown
date:
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: April 29, 2022
Non-Local Local Non-Local Non-Local Local Non-Local
For: Purchase of Off Road Equipment H&E Equipment HoltCat, LTD American Material Associated Supply Texas State Rental Austin Turf & Tractor
Services Handling Company, Inc. dba,
ASCO Equipment
6100015306 LD |5327 Tex-Con Rd 5665 SE Loop 410 3651 Mars Hill Road [2102 E. Slayton Rd. [803 SE Loop 410 809 Steve Hawkins
Pkwy
Item Description QTY |San Antonio, San Antonio, Watkinville, Lubbock, San Antonio, Marble Falls,
TX 78220 TX 78222 GA 30677 TX 79404 TX 78220 TX 78654
210-655-0048 210-213-3143 770-381-8436 806-745-2000 512-557-8454 210-601-1831
10 DELETED:
11 Trailer Mounted Message Sign - Solar 8

Charged/Battery Powered:

Price Each: $16,585.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Total: $132,680.00
Year, Make & Model Offered: 2022 Wanco WVTMM
L
Warranty: 5 year - control box,
printed circuit boards,
LED display modules,
trailer, Sign
Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: H&E Equipment
Services
Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 5327 Tex-Con Rd.,
San Antonio, TX
78220
Delivery: 60 Days|
Production Cut-off Date: Oct. 15, 2022
Last day order can be placed without Oct. 15, 2022,
missing cut-off date:
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off No
date:
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: April 29, 2022
Non-Local Local Non-Local Non-Local Local Non-Local
For: Purchase of Off Road Equipment H&E Equipment HoltCat, LTD American Material Associated Supply Texas State Rental Austin Turf & Tractor
Services Handling Company, Inc. dba,
ASCO Equipment
6100015306 LD |5327 Tex-Con Rd 5665 SE Loop 410 3651 Mars Hill Road [2102 E. Slayton Rd. [803 SE Loop 410 809 Steve Hawkins
Pkwy
Item Description QTY |San Antonio, San Antonio, Watkinville, Lubbock, San Antonio, Marble Falls,
TX 78220 TX 78222 GA 30677 TX 79404 TX 78220 TX 78654
210-655-0048 210-213-3143 770-381-8436 806-745-2000 512-557-8454 210-601-1831
12 Padfoot Drum Vibratory Roller: 1 NAS NAS
Price Each: No Bid $159,192.00 No Bid $138,500.00 $95,070.81 No Bid
Total: $159,192.00 $138,500.00 $95,070.81
Year, Make & Model Offered: 2022/23 Caterpillar] 2022/23 Case| 2022 Ammann ARS
CP44B SV207E PF 70
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered Cat C3.4B 94 .4 Net Kubota V3307-CR-| Kubota V3307-CR (75
(Include SAE net HP): HP TE5 (75HP) Hp)
Warranty: 24 Months/Unlimited 1 year/unlimited hour|3YR/3000 HR (Comes
Hours| or 2 yr/2,000 hr with first 6 months
Factory filters kit)
Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: HoltCat ASCO Equipment| Texas State Rentals
Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 5665 S. E. Loop 410, 1920 SE Loop 410, 803 SE Loop 410,
San Antonio, TX| San Antonio, Texas San Antonio, TX
78222 78220 78220
Delivery: 200 Days| 270 Days 90 Days
Production Cut-off Date: Unknown 9-30-22 7115122
Last day order can be placed without Unknown 8-31-22 7/15/22
missing cut-off date:
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off Unknown No No
date:
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: April 29, 2022
Non-Local Local Non-Local Non-Local Local Non-Local

For: Purchase of Off Road Equipment H&E Equipment HoltCat, LTD American Material Associated Supply Texas State Rental Austin Turf & Tractor

Services Handling Company, Inc. dba,
ASCO Equipment
6100015306 LD |5327 Tex-Con Rd 5665 SE Loop 410 3651 Mars Hill Road [2102 E. Slayton Rd. [803 SE Loop 410 809 Steve Hawkins
Pkwy
Item Description QTY |San Antonio, San Antonio, Watkinville, Lubbock, San Antonio, Marble Falls,
TX 78220 TX 78222 GA 30677 TX 79404 TX 78220 TX 78654
210-655-0048 210-213-3143 770-381-8436 806-745-2000 512-557-8454 210-601-1831
13 Infield Groomer with Attachments: 2

Price Each:
Total:
Year, Make & Model Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered
(Include SAE net HP):

Warranty:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$43,768.00
$87,536.00

2022 Smithco Sand
Star 1V

Briggs Vanguard V-
Twin Air Cooled - 18
HP

2 years or 1500
operational hours
from date of delivery|

Austin Turf & Tractor]

809 Steve Hawkins
Pkwy, Marble Falls,

TX 78654
Delivery: 120 Days|
Production Cut-off Date: 12/31/22
Last day order can be placed without 12/31/22
missing cut-off date:
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off No
date:

Prepared by Purchasing 7/20/2022 11 of 26




Opened:

For:

6100015306

April 29, 2022

Purchase of Off Road Equipment

LD

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Non-Local

Local

Non-Local

Non-Local

Local

Non-Local

Item

Description

QTY

H&E Equipment
Services

5327 Tex-Con Rd
San Antonio,

TX 78220
210-655-0048

HoltCat, LTD

5665 SE Loop 410

San Antonio,
TX 78222
210-213-3143

American Material
Handling

3651 Mars Hill Road
Watkinville,

GA 30677
770-381-8436

Associated Supply
Company, Inc. dba,
ASCO Equipment

2102 E. Slayton Rd.

Lubbock,
TX 79404
806-745-2000

Texas State Rental

803 SE Loop 410

San Antonio,
TX 78220
512-557-8454

Austin Turf & Tractor

809 Steve Hawkins
Pkwy

Marble Falls,

TX 78654
210-601-1831

14

Hydro-Seeder Mounted Gooseneck Trailer:

Price Each:
Total:
Year, Make & Model Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered
(Include SAE net HP):

Warranty:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:
Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Delivery:

Production Cut-off Date:

Last day order can be placed without
missing cut-off date:

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off
date:

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Prepared by Purchasing 7/20/2022
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: April 29, 2022
Non-Local Local Non-Local Non-Local Local Non-Local
For: Purchase of Off Road Equipment H&E Equipment HoltCat, LTD American Material Associated Supply Texas State Rental Austin Turf & Tractor
Services Handling Company, Inc. dba,
ASCO Equipment
6100015306 LD |5327 Tex-Con Rd 5665 SE Loop 410 3651 Mars Hill Road [2102 E. Slayton Rd. [803 SE Loop 410 809 Steve Hawkins
Pkwy
Item Description QTY |San Antonio, San Antonio, Watkinville, Lubbock, San Antonio, Marble Falls,
TX 78220 TX 78222 GA 30677 TX 79404 TX 78220 TX 78654
210-655-0048 210-213-3143 770-381-8436 806-745-2000 512-557-8454 210-601-1831
15 Mini Excavator: 1
Price Each: No Bid $59,696.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Total: $59,696.00
Percentage between lowest responsive bid 0.40%
and local bid:
Price Differential: $239.39
Year, Make & Model Offered: 2022/23 Caterpillar]
303.5CR
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered Cat C1.7 23.6 HP,
(Include SAE net HP):
Warranty: 24 months/2,000
Hours|
Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: HoltCat
Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 5665 SE Loop 410,
San Antonio, TX]|
78222
Delivery: 200 Days
Production Cut-off Date: Unknown
Last day order can be placed without Unknown
missing cut-off date:
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off Unknown
date:
Payment Terms: Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30
Total: $194,424.00 $529,753.00 $151,620.00 $484,682.00 $301,652.27 $87,536.00
Total Award: $194,424.00 $449,654.00 $151,620.00 $68,498.00 $48,096.71 $87,536.00
Prepared by Purchasing 7/20/2022 13 of 26




Opened:

For:

6100015306

April 29, 2022

Purchase of Off Road Equipment

LD

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Non-Local

Local

Non-Local

Non-Local

Non-Local

Item

Description

QTY

ROMCO Equipment
Co. LLC

1516 W Belt Line Rd

Carrollton,
TX 75006
214-819-4100

Anderson Machinery
Company, Inc.

9415 NE Loop 410

San Antonio,
TX 78219

Bobcat Company

250 East Beaton
Drive

West Fargo,
ND 58078

Boss TX

3744 SE Loop 410

San Antonio,
TX 78222

Nueces Power
Equipment

4697 FM 1516 North

Converse,
TX 78109

Operator Propelled Rotary Line Remover:
Price Each:

Total:

Year, Make & Model Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered
(Include SAE net HP):

Warranty:
Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Delivery:
Production Cut-off Date:

Last day order can be placed without
missing cut-off date:

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off
date:

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Prepared by Purchasing 7/20/2022
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: April 29, 2022
Non-Local Local Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local
For: Purchase of Off Road Equipment ROMCO Equipment |Anderson Machinery [Bobcat Company Boss TX Nueces Power
Co. LLC Company, Inc. Equipment
6100015306 LD [1516 W Belt Line Rd (9415 NE Loop 410 250 East Beaton 3744 SE Loop 410 4697 FM 1516 North
Drive
Item Description QTY |Carrollton, San Antonio, West Fargo, San Antonio, Converse,
TX 75006 TX 78219 ND 58078 TX 78222 TX 78109
214-819-4100
2 Light Duty Vibratory Compactor: 4
Price Each: No Bid $9,890.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Total: $39,560.00
Percentage between lowest responsive bid 27.12%
and local bid:
Price Differential: $8,440.00
Year, Make & Model Offered: 2022 Bomag BW55E
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered Honda 3.4HP
(Include SAE net HP):
Warranty: One (1) Year/2000 Hr
(whichever comes
first)
Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Anderson Machinery
Company, Inc.
Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 9415 NE Loop 410,
San Antonio, TX
78219
Delivery: 30-180 Days
Production Cut-off Date: July 31st 2022,
Subject to availability
Last day order can be placed without July 31st 2022
missing cut-off date:
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off No
date:
Prepared by Purchasing 7/20/2022 15 of 26



Opened:

For:

6100015306

April 29, 2022

Purchase of Off Road Equipment

LD

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Non-Local

Local

Non-Local

Non-Local

Non-Local

Item

Description

QTY

ROMCO Equipment
Co. LLC

1516 W Belt Line Rd

Carrollton,
TX 75006
214-819-4100

Anderson Machinery
Company, Inc.

9415 NE Loop 410

San Antonio,
TX 78219

Bobcat Company

250 East Beaton
Drive

West Fargo,
ND 58078

Boss TX

3744 SE Loop 410

San Antonio,
TX 78222

Nueces Power
Equipment

4697 FM 1516 North

Converse,
TX 78109

Trailer Mounted QOil Distributors:
Price Each:
Total:

Year, Make & Model Qil Distributor Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered
(Include SAE net HP):

Make & Model of Trailer Offered:

Oil Distributor & Trailer Warranty:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Delivery:

Production Cut-off Date:

Last day order can be placed without
missing cut-off date:

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off
date:

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Prepared by Purchasing 7/20/2022
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Opened:

For:

6100015306

April 29, 2022

Purchase of Off Road Equipment

LD

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Non-Local

Local

Non-Local

Non-Local

Non-Local

Item

Description

QTY

ROMCO Equipment
Co. LLC

1516 W Belt Line Rd

Carrollton,
TX 75006
214-819-4100

Anderson Machinery
Company, Inc.

9415 NE Loop 410

San Antonio,
TX 78219

Bobcat Company

250 East Beaton
Drive

West Fargo,
ND 58078

Boss TX

3744 SE Loop 410

San Antonio,
TX 78222

Nueces Power
Equipment

4697 FM 1516 North

Converse,
TX 78109

6,000 Ib. Pneumatic Tired Forklift LPG:

Price Each:

Total:

Percentage between lowest responsive bid
and local bid:

Price Differential:

Year, Make & Model Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered
(Include SAE net HP):

Warranty:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Delivery:

Production Cut-off Date:

Last day order can be placed without
missing cut-off date:

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off
date:

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Prepared by Purchasing 7/20/2022
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: April 29, 2022
Non-Local Local Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local
For: Purchase of Off Road Equipment ROMCO Equipment |Anderson Machinery [Bobcat Company Boss TX Nueces Power
Co. LLC Company, Inc. Equipment
6100015306 LD |1516 W Belt Line Rd [9415 NE Loop 410 250 East Beaton 3744 SE Loop 410 4697 FM 1516 North
Drive
Item Description QTY |Carrollton, San Antonio, West Fargo, San Antonio, Converse,
TX 75006 TX 78219 ND 58078 TX 78222 TX 78109
214-819-4100
5 Tracked Skid Loader w/Attachments: 1
Price Each: No Bid No Bid $77,862.76 $73,554.34 No Bid
Total: $77,862.76 $73,554.34
Percentage between lowest responsive bid 6.87%
and local bid:
Price Differential: $5,056.34
Year, Make & Model Offered: 2022 Bobcat T740 2022 JBC 270T
Compact Track
Loader
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered 3.4L BOBCAT| JCB Econo Max 4.4L,
(Include SAE net HP): ENGINE - 70.9 SAE 74 Hp
NET HP -
Warranty: 2 Year or 2000 hours 2 Yr, 2,000 Hr Full
of use, whichever Warranty
occurs first.
Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Bobcat of San Antonio Boss JCB
Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 11146 1.H. 35 North, 3744 SE Loop 410,
San Antonio, TX San Antonio, TX
78233 78222
Delivery: 270 Days 180 Days
Production Cut-off Date: Prices Valid until 5/31 9/30/22
Last day order can be placed without 5/31/2022 6/30/22
missing cut-off date:
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off Y - <5/31/2022 Yes
date:
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: April 29, 2022
Non-Local Local Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local
For: Purchase of Off Road Equipment ROMCO Equipment |Anderson Machinery [Bobcat Company Boss TX Nueces Power
Co. LLC Company, Inc. Equipment
6100015306 LD |1516 W Belt Line Rd [9415 NE Loop 410 250 East Beaton 3744 SE Loop 410 4697 FM 1516 North
Drive
Item Description QTY |Carrollton, San Antonio, West Fargo, San Antonio, Converse,
TX 75006 TX 78219 ND 58078 TX 78222 TX 78109
214-819-4100
6 Wheeled Skid Loader — Open Cab min 60 HP: 1
Price Each: No Bid No Bid $50,456.14 $48,106.90 No Bid
Total: $50,456.14 $48,106.90

Year, Make & Model Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered
(Include SAE net HP):

Warranty:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Delivery:
Production Cut-off Date:

Last day order can be placed without
missing cut-off date:

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off
date:

2022 Bobcat S62 Skid
Steer Loader

Doosan DO 2.4L -
64.9 SAE NET HP

2 Year or 2000 hours
of use, whichever
occurs first.
Limitations Apply, see
included warranty
statement.

Bobcat of San Antonio
11146 I.H. North, San
Antonio, TX 78233
270 Days

Prices Valid until 5/31
5/31/2022

Y - <5/31/2022

2022 JCB 215

JBC by Kohler 2.5L,
74 Hp

2 Yr, 2,000 Hr Full
Warranty

Boss JCB

3744 SE Loop 410,
San Antonio, TX
78222

180 Days

9/30/22

6/30/22

Yes

Prepared by Purchasing 7/20/2022




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: April 29, 2022
Non-Local Local Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local
For: Purchase of Off Road Equipment ROMCO Equipment |Anderson Machinery [Bobcat Company Boss TX Nueces Power
Co. LLC Company, Inc. Equipment
6100015306 LD |1516 W Belt Line Rd [9415 NE Loop 410 250 East Beaton 3744 SE Loop 410 4697 FM 1516 North
Drive
Item Description QTY |Carrollton, San Antonio, West Fargo, San Antonio, Converse,
TX 75006 TX 78219 ND 58078 TX 78222 TX 78109
214-819-4100
7 Wheeled Skid Loader — Enclosed, min 69 1
HP:
Price Each: No Bid No Bid $59,456.61 $61,419.71 No Bid
Total: $59,456.61 $61,419.71
Percentage between lowest responsive bid 10.19%
and local bid:
Price Differential: $5,680.71
Year, Make & Model Offered: 2022 Bobcat S66 Skid 2022 JCB 270
Steer Loader
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered Doosan DO 2.4L -[ JCB Ecomax 4.4L, 74
(Include SAE net HP): 70.5 SAE NET HP Hp
Warranty: 2 Year or 2000 hours 2 Yr, 2,000 Hr Full
of use, whichever Warranty
occurs first.
Limitations Apply, see
included warranty
statement.
Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Bobcat of San Antonio Boss JCB
Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 11146 1.H. 35 North, 3744 SE Loop 410,
San Antonio, TX San Antonio, TX
78233 78222
Delivery: 270 Days 180 Days
Production Cut-off Date: Prices Valid until 5/31 9/30/22
Last day order can be placed without 5/31/2022 6/30/22
missing cut-off date:
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off Y - <5/31/2022 Yes
date:
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Opened:

For:

6100015306

April 29, 2022

Purchase of Off Road Equipment

LD

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Non-Local

Local

Non-Local

Non-Local

Non-Local

Item

Description

QTY

ROMCO Equipment
Co. LLC

1516 W Belt Line Rd

Carrollton,
TX 75006
214-819-4100

Anderson Machinery
Company, Inc.

9415 NE Loop 410

San Antonio,
TX 78219

Bobcat Company

250 East Beaton
Drive

West Fargo,
ND 58078

Boss TX

3744 SE Loop 410

San Antonio,
TX 78222

Nueces Power
Equipment

4697 FM 1516 North

Converse,
TX 78109

DELETED:
Tired Pneumatic Roller:

Price Each:
Total:
Year, Make & Model Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered
(Include SAE net HP):

Warranty:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Delivery:

Production Cut-off Date:

Last day order can be placed without
missing cut-off date:

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off
date:

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Prepared by Purchasing 7/20/2022
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Opened:

For:

6100015306

April 29, 2022

Purchase of Off Road Equipment

LD

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Non-Local

Local

Non-Local

Non-Local

Non-Local

Item

Description

QTY

ROMCO Equipment
Co. LLC

1516 W Belt Line Rd

Carrollton,
TX 75006
214-819-4100

Anderson Machinery
Company, Inc.

9415 NE Loop 410

San Antonio,
TX 78219

Bobcat Company

250 East Beaton
Drive

West Fargo,
ND 58078

Boss TX

3744 SE Loop 410

San Antonio,
TX 78222

Nueces Power
Equipment

4697 FM 1516 North

Converse,
TX 78109

10

11

DELETED:

Trailer Mounted Message Sign - Solar
Charged/Battery Powered:

Price Each:

Total:

Year, Make & Model Offered:

Warranty:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Delivery:

Production Cut-off Date:

Last day order can be placed without
missing cut-off date:

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off
date:

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Prepared by Purchasing 7/20/2022
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Opened:

For:

6100015306

April 29, 2022

Purchase of Off Road Equipment

LD

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Non-Local

Local

Non-Local

Non-Local

Non-Local

Item

Description

QTY

ROMCO Equipment
Co. LLC

1516 W Belt Line Rd

Carrollton,
TX 75006
214-819-4100

Anderson Machinery
Company, Inc.

9415 NE Loop 410

San Antonio,
TX 78219

Bobcat Company

250 East Beaton
Drive

West Fargo,
ND 58078

Boss TX

3744 SE Loop 410

San Antonio,
TX 78222

Nueces Power
Equipment

4697 FM 1516 North

Converse,
TX 78109

12

Padfoot Drum Vibratory Roller:

Price Each:
Total:
Year, Make & Model Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered
(Include SAE net HP):

Warranty:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Delivery:

Production Cut-off Date:

Last day order can be placed without
missing cut-off date:

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off
date:

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
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Opened:

For:

6100015306

April 29, 2022

Purchase of Off Road Equipment

LD

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Non-Local

Local

Non-Local

Non-Local

Non-Local

Item

Description

QTY

ROMCO Equipment
Co. LLC

1516 W Belt Line Rd

Carrollton,
TX 75006
214-819-4100

Anderson Machinery
Company, Inc.

9415 NE Loop 410

San Antonio,
TX 78219

Bobcat Company

250 East Beaton
Drive

West Fargo,
ND 58078

Boss TX

3744 SE Loop 410

San Antonio,
TX 78222

Nueces Power
Equipment

4697 FM 1516 North

Converse,
TX 78109

13

Infield Groomer with Attachments:
Price Each:

Total:

Year, Make & Model Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered
(Include SAE net HP):

Warranty:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Delivery:

Production Cut-off Date:

Last day order can be placed without
missing cut-off date:

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off
date:

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Prepared by Purchasing 7/20/2022
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: April 29, 2022
Non-Local Local Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local
For: Purchase of Off Road Equipment ROMCO Equipment |Anderson Machinery [Bobcat Company Boss TX Nueces Power
Co. LLC Company, Inc. Equipment
6100015306 LD [1516 W Belt Line Rd (9415 NE Loop 410 250 East Beaton 3744 SE Loop 410 4697 FM 1516 North
Drive
Item Description QTY |Carrollton, San Antonio, West Fargo, San Antonio, Converse,
TX 75006 TX 78219 ND 58078 TX 78222 TX 78109
214-819-4100
14 Hydro-Seeder Mounted Gooseneck Trailer: 1
Price Each: $97,500.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Total: $97,500.00
Year, Make & Model Offered: 2022 FINN T120GN
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered 35.1 HP Yammar|
(Include SAE net HP): 3TNV88C-DYEM
TIER 4F
Warranty: 2 Year Full Machine
Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: ROMCO Equipment|
Co. LLC|
Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 1042 S E Loop 410,
San Antonio
Delivery: TBD|
Production Cut-off Date: TBD|
Last day order can be placed without TBD|
missing cut-off date:
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off TBD|
date:
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: April 29, 2022
Non-Local Local Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local
For: Purchase of Off Road Equipment ROMCO Equipment |Anderson Machinery [Bobcat Company Boss TX Nueces Power
Co. LLC Company, Inc. Equipment
6100015306 LD |1516 W Belt Line Rd |9415 NE Loop 410 250 East Beaton 3744 SE Loop 410 4697 FM 1516 North
Drive
Item Description QTY |Carrollton, San Antonio, West Fargo, San Antonio, Converse,
TX 75006 TX 78219 ND 58078 TX 78222 TX 78109
214-819-4100
15 Mini Excavator: 1
Price Each: No Bid No Bid $59,456.61 No Bid No Bid
Total: $59,456.61
Percentage between lowest responsive bid
and local bid:
Price Differential:
Year, Make & Model Offered: 2022 Bobcat S66 Skid
Steer Loader
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered Doosan DO 2.4L -
(Include SAE net HP): 70.5 SAE NET HP
Warranty: 2 Year or 2000 hours
of use, whichever
occurs first.
Limitations Apply, see
included warranty
statement.
Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Bobcat of San Antonio
Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 11146 1.H. 35 North,
San Antonio, TX
78233
Delivery: 270 Days
Production Cut-off Date: Prices Valid until 5/31
Last day order can be placed without 5/31/2022
missing cut-off date:
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off Y - <5/31/2022
date:
Payment Terms: Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30
Total: $97,500.00 $39,560.00 $247,232.12 $183,080.95
Total Award: $97,500.00
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